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From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <ODN/EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/RECIPIENTS/SMITHHISLER, GUS4AE>
To: "Justison, Emily" <Emily.Justison@dot.state.oh.us>
CC: "Middleton, Gary" <Gary.Middleton@dot.state.oh.us>
Subject: RE: Caesar Creek
Sent: 4/18/2013 12:47:18 PM +00:00

Attachments: 1. 2013 - Caesar Creek State Park_Strawser Quote.pdf
2. ODNR Caeser Creek 040113.pdf

Emily,

| have two quotes for work at Caesar Creek. One is for chip-sealing and striping (Strawser), the other is for
pavement repair (Pavement Management). Please let me know if these are appropriate or if | need to do
something additional.

-Gus

From: Justison, Emily

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2013 8:24 AM
To: Smithhisler, Gus

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Hi Gus —

ODOT will be able to use the 101G Contract for funding in the road repair at Caesar Creek State Park.
Before proceeding with the order, we need to make sure that we are using the lowest responsible
vendor.

Thanks,

Emily
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From: Smithhisler, Gus

Sent: Tuesday, April 02, 2013 8:28 AM
To: Justison, Emily; Middleton, Gary
Cc: Filbert, Tom

Subject: Caesar Creek

Gary/Emily,

| have money budgeted for some road repairs at Caesar Creek State Park. | would like to use the 101 contracts
to get the repairs done this spring. We were able to get these things accomplished at Cowan Lake last year, but
| recall there were some issues with how we went about getting the work done. Caesar Creek is going to be a
smaller project and more focused on repair work and chip-seal on a few roads. | would like to work with you on
getting this work completed this spring. | am working again with Strawser and Pavement Management on some
estimates. Please let me know how you would like to proceed.

Also, | have money set aside for FY 2015 that will likely be partially used at Caesar Creek as well as some other
facilities in your district. | would like to start coordinating on these projects soon as well.

-Taul ‘Gus’ Smiithtister, I.E

ODNR - Roadway Maintenance Program Manager
Division of Engineering

2045 Morse Road, Bldg E-3

Columbus, Ohio 43229-6693

(614) 265-6965

Message Headers: Received: from SOCEMMBOZ.em.ohio.gov ([66.144.48.72]) by SOCEMMBOS5
([66.144.48.75]) with mapi id 14.02.0342.003; Thu, 18 Apr 2013 08
Content-Type: application/ms-tnef; name="winmail.dat"
Content-Transfer-Encoding: binary
From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <Gus.Smithhisler@dnr.state.oh.us>
To: "Justison, Emily" <Emily.Justison@dot.state.oh.us>
CC: "Middleton, Gary" <Gary.Middleton@dot.state.oh.us>
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Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Thread-Topic: Caesar Creek

Thread-Index: Acd4vnXgxxmYJnaOZQ5GbkAPzM53W2wMkTRAWAADN4 CcA=

Date: Thu, 18 Apr 2013 08:47:18 -0400

Message-ID: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EAI9F6F08F09349CESOCEMMBO2>
References: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EAL19F6F08F0730E40@SOCEMMBO2>
<DF9C5BA44282F04D8D842109B32E563419171111@SOCEMMBO4>
In-Reply-To: <DF9C5BA44282F04D8D842109B32E563419171111@SOCEMMBO4>

Accept-Language: en-US

Content-Language: en-US

X-MS-Has-Attach: yes

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-SCL: -1

X-MS-TNEF-Correlator: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EA19F6F08F09349CESOCE

MIME-Version: 1.0

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthSource: SOCEMMBO05.em.ohio.gov
X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthAs: Internal
X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthMechanism: 03

X-Originating-IP: [66.145.151.38]
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Strawser
Construction
Inc.

Moving Pavement Preservation Forward

April 4, 2012

Ohio Department of Natural Resources

2045 Morse Road

Columbus, Ohio 43229-6605

Attn: Gus Smithhisler - Roadway Maintenance Program Manager

Re: Caesar State Park utilizing the ODOT 101G-14 Co-Operative Purchasing Contract
Gus,

Strawser Construction, Inc. is pleased to present the following proposal for your consideration. We will
furnish all labor, equipment and materials necessary to complete the following scope of work:

Process - Single Course Chip Seal
Process Specification - ODOT #422
Unit Number - #30

Unit Price - $4.67/SY

Units - 36,961 SY

Process Unit Price Units Extended Cost
Single Course Chip Seal $4.67/SY 36,961 SY $172,607.87
Line Striping w/ misc symbols $0.58/LF 13,126 LF $7,613.08
Total $180,220.95
Notes:

*Strawser Construction, Inc. is not responsible for sub base problems or damage to pavement surface due to
construction equipment required to complete this project

-Traffic Control and all mobilization are included within price.

-Prices are quoted as unit prices and any change to units installed will affect finalized costThank you

Zack Helm

Technical Sales Representative
Strawser Construction, Inc.
Cell: 937-657-9527

APPROVAL:

The above price is hereby accepted. Strawser Construction, Inc. is authorized to perform the work as
specified. Acceptance indicates that funds are available for this project and payment will be made to Strawser
as outlined above.

Name Title Date
Equal Opportunity Employer

1595 Frank Road Columbus, OH 43223 Tel 614/276-5501 Fax 614/ 276-0570
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PRAVEMENT PROPOSAL

MANAGEMENT

Pavement Management, Inc.
4014 Colerain Avenue

Cincinnati, Ohio 45223

(513) 591-0303
591-0381 fax

Parking Lots
Roads
Demolition
Drainage

« Asphalt Paving
» Asphalt Repairs
«» Sealcoating

« Linestriping

« Catch Basins

« Drain Pipe

« Site Grading

« Concrete Curbs

« Concrete Work

StreetPrint

» Pavement Texturing

April 1, 2013

Ohio Department of Natural Resources
Caesar Creek State Park

8570 East State Rt. 73

Waynesville, Ohio 45068-9719

Attn: Gus Smithhisler

Re: 2013 Miscellaneous Asphalt Repairs at Caesar Creek State Park
Approximately 36 Areas Throughout the Park

Materials

Item 17 301 Asphalt Concrete Base 60 tons @ $62.90 | $3,774.00

Item 10 448 Asphalt Concrete Type 1 60 tons @ $64.50 | $3,870.00

Item 10 448 Asphalt Concrete Type 1 — 65 tons @ $64.50 | $4,192.50
Leveling

Grinder RP42 or smaller, includes Bobcat with operator

Bobcat w/ 24" grinder Model S220 20 hours @ $190.00 | $3,800.00

Excavator w/ operator Komatsu PC78MR6 20 hours @ $140.00 | $2,800.00

Miscellaneous Equipment (paving related) with operator

Roller Bomag BW161 20 hours @ $120.00 | $2,400.00
Roller Bomag BW 138 20 hours @ $90.00 | $1,800.00
Pickup truck with foreman Ford F series 33 hours @ $85.00 | $2,805.00

Miscellaneous Traffic Control

Barricade Trailer — traffic cones 33 hours @ $35.00 | $1,155.00

Trucking — Lowboy with operator

Drag 9 hours @ $105.00 $945.00

Drag 9 hours @ $105.00 $945.00
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PRVEMENT

MANAGEMENT

Trucking with Operator

Trucking 15 to 20 miles Stubbs Mill Rd. to | 185 tons of asphalt hauled $1,008.25
Distance US 42, follow north to St. Rt. 73 | @ $5.45 per ton
— East to park entrance

Trucking Miscellaneous

(3) Dump Trucks — Tandem with Operators

(1) truck 36 hours @ $60.00 $2,160.00
(1) truck 36 hours @ $60.00 $2,160.00
(1) truck 36 hours @ $60.00 $2,160.00

Total | $35,974.75

We are pleased to have this opportunity to submit this proposal for the above
work. If you would like to schedule a review meeting prior to executing a contract, we
would be happy to meet with you at your convenience to answer questions. Please
contact me at 513-591-0303 if there is any additional information needed.

Sincerely,
Daniel jﬂﬁ
Pavement Management, Inc.






