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From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <ODN/EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE
GROUP (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/RECIPIENTS/SMITHHISLER, GUS4AE>
To: 1 "Justison, Emily" <Emily.Justison@dot.state.oh.us>

2. "Middleton, Gary" <Gary.Middleton@dot.state.oh.us>
CC: "Filbert, Tom" <Tom.Filbert@dnr.state.oh.us>
Subject: Caesar Creek
Sent: 4/2/2013 12:27:41 PM +00:00
Gary/Emily,

| have money budgeted for some road repairs at Caesar Creek State Park. | would like to use the
101 contracts to get the repairs done this spring. We were able to get these things accomplished
at Cowan Lake last year, but | recall there were some issues with how we went about getting the
work done. Caesar Creek is going to be a smaller project and more focused on repair work and
chip-seal on a few roads. | would like to work with you on getting this work completed this spring.
| am working again with Strawser and Pavement Management on some estimates. Please let me
know how you would like to proceed.

Also, | have money set aside for FY 2015 that will likely be partially used at Caesar Creek as well
as some other facilities in your district. | would like to start coordinating on these projects soon as
well.

-Saul Gus’ Smuthfiustler, J.E.
ODNR - Roadway Maintenance Program Manager
Division of Engineering

2045 Morse Road, Bldg E-3

Columbus, Ohio 43229-6693

(614) 265-6965

Message Headers: Received: from SOCEMMBO2.em.ohio.gov ([66.144.48.72]) by
SOCEMHUBO2
([66.144.48.36]) with mapi id 14.02.0342.003; Tue, 2 Apr 2013 08:27:42 -0400
Content-Type: application/ms-tnef; name="winmail.dat"
Content-Transfer-Encoding: binary
From: "Smithhisler, Gus'" <Gus.Smithhisler@dnr.state.oh.us>
To: "Justison, Emily" <Emily.Justison@dot.state.oh.us>, "Middleton, Gary"
<Gary.Middleton@dot.state.oh.us>
CC: "Filbert, Tom" <Tom.Filbert@dnr.state.oh.us>
Subject: Caesar Creek
Thread-Topic: Caesar Creek
Thread-Index: Ac4vnXgxxmYJna0ZQ5GbkAPzM53W2w==
Date: Tue, 2 Apr 2013 08:27:41 -0400
Message-1D: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EA19F6F08F0730E4@SOCEMMBO2>
Accept-Language: en-US
Content-Language: en-US
X-MS-Has-Attach:




Exhibit 1

Page 2 of 2

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-SCL: -1

X-MS-TNEF-Correlator: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EA19F6F08F0730E4@SOCEMMBO2>
MIME-Version: 1.0

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthSource: SOCEMHUBOZ2.em.ohio.gov
X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthAs: Internal
X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthMechanism: 03

X-Originating-1P: [66.145.151.38]
X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AVStamp-Mailbox: MSFTFF;1;0;0 O O
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From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <ODN/EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/RECIPIENTS/SMITHHISLER, GUS4AE>
To: "Justison, Emily" <Emily.Justison@dot.state.oh.us>
Subject: RE: Caesar Creek
Sent: 4/22/2013 12:41:48 PM +00:00

Attachments: DOC042213-04222013083656.pdf
Here you go. If you need anything else, please ask!

-Gus

From: Justison, Emily

Sent: Monday, April 22, 2013 8:14 AM
To: Smithhisler, Gus

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Okay. Would you at least be able to send a map of the park and highlight the areas to be repaired?

Thank you!

Emily

From: Smithhisler, Gus

Sent: Monday, April 22, 2013 8:12 AM
To: Justison, Emily

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

There are no plans. We were simply looking to repair and resurface (chip-seal) roads 1, 2, 3, 4 & 34. Itincludes
some full-depth repair as well as some leveling, then resurfacing and striping.
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-Gus

From: Justison, Emily

Sent: Monday, April 22, 2013 7:26 AM
To: Smithhisler, Gus

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Hi Gus —
Would you be able to send me a copy of the plans for this project?

Thank you,

Emily

From: Smithhisler, Gus

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2013 8:47 AM
To: Justison, Emily

Cc: Middleton, Gary

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Emily,

| have two quotes for work at Caesar Creek. One is for chip-sealing and striping (Strawser), the other is for
pavement repair (Pavement Management). Please let me know if these are appropriate or if | need to do
something additional.
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-Gus

From: Justison, Emily

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2013 8:24 AM
To: Smithhisler, Gus

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Hi Gus —

ODOT will be able to use the 101G Contract for funding in the road repair at Caesar Creek State Park.
Before proceeding with the order, we need to make sure that we are using the lowest responsible

vendor.

Thanks,

Emily

From: Smithhisler, Gus

Sent: Tuesday, April 02, 2013 8:28 AM
To: Justison, Emily; Middleton, Gary
Cc: Filbert, Tom

Subject: Caesar Creek

Gary/Emily,

| have money budgeted for some road repairs at Caesar Creek State Park. | would like to use the 101 contracts
to get the repairs done this spring. We were able to get these things accomplished at Cowan Lake last year, but
| recall there were some issues with how we went about getting the work done. Caesar Creek is going to be a
smaller project and more focused on repair work and chip-seal on a few roads. | would like to work with you on
getting this work completed this spring. | am working again with Strawser and Pavement Management on some
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estimates. Please let me know how you would like to proceed.

Also, | have money set aside for FY 2015 that will likely be partially used at Caesar Creek as well as some other
facilities in your district. | would like to start coordinating on these projects soon as well.

-Fael ‘Cus’ Smithhisler, PE.
ODNR - Roadway Maintenance Program Manager
Division of Engineering

2045 Morse Road, Bldg E-3

Columbus, Ohio 43229-6693

(614) 265-6965

Message Headers: Received: from SOCEMMBOZ.em.ohio.gov ([66.144.48.72]) by SOCEMHUBO

([66.144.48.36]) with mapi id 14.02.0342.003; Mon, 22 Apr 2013 08

Content-Type: application/ms-tnef; name="winmail.dat"

Content-Transfer-Encoding: binary

From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <Gus.Smithhisler@dnr.state.oh.us>

To: "Justison, Emily" <Emily.Justison@dot.state.oh.us>

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Thread-Topic: Caesar Creek

Thread-Index: Ac4vnXgxxmYJnaOZQ5GbkAPzM53W2wMkTRAWAADN4cAAXNrXsAAB

Date: Mon, 22 Apr 2013 08:41:48 -0400

Message-ID: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EALI9F6F08F0968B1@SOCEMMBO2>

References: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EA19F6FO08F0730E4Q@SOCEMMBO2>
<DF9C5BA44282F04D8D842109B32E563419171111@SOCEMMBO4>
<11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EAL9F6F08F09349CRSOCEMMBO2>
<DF9C5BA44282F04D8D842109B32E56341917137EQ@SOCEMMBO4>
<11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EA19F6F08F096898R@SOCEMMBO2>
<DF9C5BA44282F04D8D842109B32E56341917150D@SOCEMMBO04 >

In-Reply-To: <DF9C5BA44282F04D8D842109B32E56341917150DESOCEMMBO4>

Accept-Language: en-US

Content-Language: en-US

X-MS-Has-Attach: yes

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-SCL: -1

X-MS-TNEF-Correlator: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EA1I9F6F08F0968B1@SOCE

MIME-Version: 1.0

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthSource: SOCEMHUBOZ.em.ohio.gov

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthAs: Internal

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthMechanism: 03

X-Originating-IP: [66.145.151.38]

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AVStamp-Mailbox: MSFTFF;1;0;0 0 O
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From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <ODN/EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/RECIPIENTS/SMITHHISLER, GUS4AE>
To: "Justison, Emily" <Emily.Justison@dot.state.oh.us>
CC: "Middleton, Gary" <Gary.Middleton@dot.state.oh.us>
Subject: RE: Caesar Creek
Sent: 4/18/2013 12:47:18 PM +00:00

Attachments: 1. 2013 - Caesar Creek State Park_Strawser Quote.pdf
2. ODNR Caeser Creek 040113.pdf

Emily,

| have two quotes for work at Caesar Creek. One is for chip-sealing and striping (Strawser), the other is for
pavement repair (Pavement Management). Please let me know if these are appropriate or if | need to do
something additional.

-Gus

From: Justison, Emily

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2013 8:24 AM
To: Smithhisler, Gus

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Hi Gus —

ODOT will be able to use the 101G Contract for funding in the road repair at Caesar Creek State Park.
Before proceeding with the order, we need to make sure that we are using the lowest responsible
vendor.

Thanks,

Emily
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From: Smithhisler, Gus

Sent: Tuesday, April 02, 2013 8:28 AM
To: Justison, Emily; Middleton, Gary
Cc: Filbert, Tom

Subject: Caesar Creek

Gary/Emily,

| have money budgeted for some road repairs at Caesar Creek State Park. | would like to use the 101 contracts
to get the repairs done this spring. We were able to get these things accomplished at Cowan Lake last year, but
| recall there were some issues with how we went about getting the work done. Caesar Creek is going to be a
smaller project and more focused on repair work and chip-seal on a few roads. | would like to work with you on
getting this work completed this spring. | am working again with Strawser and Pavement Management on some
estimates. Please let me know how you would like to proceed.

Also, | have money set aside for FY 2015 that will likely be partially used at Caesar Creek as well as some other
facilities in your district. | would like to start coordinating on these projects soon as well.

-Taul ‘Gus’ Smiithtister, I.E

ODNR - Roadway Maintenance Program Manager
Division of Engineering

2045 Morse Road, Bldg E-3

Columbus, Ohio 43229-6693

(614) 265-6965

Message Headers: Received: from SOCEMMBOZ.em.ohio.gov ([66.144.48.72]) by SOCEMMBOS5
([66.144.48.75]) with mapi id 14.02.0342.003; Thu, 18 Apr 2013 08
Content-Type: application/ms-tnef; name="winmail.dat"
Content-Transfer-Encoding: binary
From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <Gus.Smithhisler@dnr.state.oh.us>
To: "Justison, Emily" <Emily.Justison@dot.state.oh.us>
CC: "Middleton, Gary" <Gary.Middleton@dot.state.oh.us>
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Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Thread-Topic: Caesar Creek

Thread-Index: Acd4vnXgxxmYJnaOZQ5GbkAPzM53W2wMkTRAWAADN4 CcA=

Date: Thu, 18 Apr 2013 08:47:18 -0400

Message-ID: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EAI9F6F08F09349CESOCEMMBO2>
References: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EAL19F6F08F0730E40@SOCEMMBO2>
<DF9C5BA44282F04D8D842109B32E563419171111@SOCEMMBO4>
In-Reply-To: <DF9C5BA44282F04D8D842109B32E563419171111@SOCEMMBO4>

Accept-Language: en-US

Content-Language: en-US

X-MS-Has-Attach: yes

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-SCL: -1

X-MS-TNEF-Correlator: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EA19F6F08F09349CESOCE

MIME-Version: 1.0

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthSource: SOCEMMBO05.em.ohio.gov
X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthAs: Internal
X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthMechanism: 03

X-Originating-IP: [66.145.151.38]
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Strawser
Construction
Inc.

Moving Pavement Preservation Forward

April 4, 2012

Ohio Department of Natural Resources

2045 Morse Road

Columbus, Ohio 43229-6605

Attn: Gus Smithhisler - Roadway Maintenance Program Manager

Re: Caesar State Park utilizing the ODOT 101G-14 Co-Operative Purchasing Contract
Gus,

Strawser Construction, Inc. is pleased to present the following proposal for your consideration. We will
furnish all labor, equipment and materials necessary to complete the following scope of work:

Process - Single Course Chip Seal
Process Specification - ODOT #422
Unit Number - #30

Unit Price - $4.67/SY

Units - 36,961 SY

Process Unit Price Units Extended Cost
Single Course Chip Seal $4.67/SY 36,961 SY $172,607.87
Line Striping w/ misc symbols $0.58/LF 13,126 LF $7,613.08
Total $180,220.95
Notes:

*Strawser Construction, Inc. is not responsible for sub base problems or damage to pavement surface due to
construction equipment required to complete this project

-Traffic Control and all mobilization are included within price.

-Prices are quoted as unit prices and any change to units installed will affect finalized costThank you

Zack Helm

Technical Sales Representative
Strawser Construction, Inc.
Cell: 937-657-9527

APPROVAL:

The above price is hereby accepted. Strawser Construction, Inc. is authorized to perform the work as
specified. Acceptance indicates that funds are available for this project and payment will be made to Strawser
as outlined above.

Name Title Date
Equal Opportunity Employer

1595 Frank Road Columbus, OH 43223 Tel 614/276-5501 Fax 614/ 276-0570
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PRAVEMENT PROPOSAL

MANAGEMENT

Pavement Management, Inc.
4014 Colerain Avenue

Cincinnati, Ohio 45223

(513) 591-0303
591-0381 fax

Parking Lots
Roads
Demolition
Drainage

« Asphalt Paving
» Asphalt Repairs
«» Sealcoating

« Linestriping

« Catch Basins

« Drain Pipe

« Site Grading

« Concrete Curbs

« Concrete Work

StreetPrint

» Pavement Texturing

April 1, 2013

Ohio Department of Natural Resources
Caesar Creek State Park

8570 East State Rt. 73

Waynesville, Ohio 45068-9719

Attn: Gus Smithhisler

Re: 2013 Miscellaneous Asphalt Repairs at Caesar Creek State Park
Approximately 36 Areas Throughout the Park

Materials

Item 17 301 Asphalt Concrete Base 60 tons @ $62.90 | $3,774.00

Item 10 448 Asphalt Concrete Type 1 60 tons @ $64.50 | $3,870.00

Item 10 448 Asphalt Concrete Type 1 — 65 tons @ $64.50 | $4,192.50
Leveling

Grinder RP42 or smaller, includes Bobcat with operator

Bobcat w/ 24" grinder Model S220 20 hours @ $190.00 | $3,800.00

Excavator w/ operator Komatsu PC78MR6 20 hours @ $140.00 | $2,800.00

Miscellaneous Equipment (paving related) with operator

Roller Bomag BW161 20 hours @ $120.00 | $2,400.00
Roller Bomag BW 138 20 hours @ $90.00 | $1,800.00
Pickup truck with foreman Ford F series 33 hours @ $85.00 | $2,805.00

Miscellaneous Traffic Control

Barricade Trailer — traffic cones 33 hours @ $35.00 | $1,155.00

Trucking — Lowboy with operator

Drag 9 hours @ $105.00 $945.00

Drag 9 hours @ $105.00 $945.00
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PRVEMENT

MANAGEMENT

Trucking with Operator

Trucking 15 to 20 miles Stubbs Mill Rd. to | 185 tons of asphalt hauled $1,008.25
Distance US 42, follow north to St. Rt. 73 | @ $5.45 per ton
— East to park entrance

Trucking Miscellaneous

(3) Dump Trucks — Tandem with Operators

(1) truck 36 hours @ $60.00 $2,160.00
(1) truck 36 hours @ $60.00 $2,160.00
(1) truck 36 hours @ $60.00 $2,160.00

Total | $35,974.75

We are pleased to have this opportunity to submit this proposal for the above
work. If you would like to schedule a review meeting prior to executing a contract, we
would be happy to meet with you at your convenience to answer questions. Please
contact me at 513-591-0303 if there is any additional information needed.

Sincerely,
Daniel jﬂﬁ
Pavement Management, Inc.
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STATE OF OHIO ODOT P.O.NUMBER: 341823
PAGE: 1of1 PURCH ASE OH DER OAKS P.O. NUMBER: 0000066306
Ei : D .
DOGUMENTTYPE:  OROE OHIO DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION P.O.DATE:  05/07/13
TYPE CODE: 01 REQUISITION NUMBER: 040243
PID NUMBER | CONTRACT/EID/ OiH | EXPIRATION DATE | CONTROL BOARD NBR. | DAS RELEASE / PERMITNBR. | TOTAL AMQUNT
000085911 DOT101G14-49 02/28/14 $180,220.95
VENDOR INFORMATION:

NAME: STRAWSER CONSTRUCTION INC QAKS VENDOR NUMBER: S
ADDRESS 1: 1535 FRANK RD VENDOR CONTACT PERSON: EMILY JUSTISON
ADDRESS 2: PHONE NUMBER: (513) 933-8502

CITY, STATE: COLUMBUS OH DELIVERY REQUIRED {DATE/AROQ):
ZIP CODE: 43223 TERMS:
COUNTY: D08 ADDRESS CODE: 001 MAY 0 8 20 13
BILL TO: SHIP TO:

NAME: DOT OHIO DEPT TRANSPORTATION NAME: DOT OHIO DEPT TRANSPORTATION
ADDRESS 1: 505 SOUTH STATE ROUTE 741 ADDRESS 1: 505 SOUTH STATE ROUTE 741
ADDRESS 2: ADDRESS 2:

CITY, STATE: LEBANON OH CITY, STATE: LEBANON OH
ZIP CODE: 45036 Z1P CODE: 45036
VENDOR WILL PERFORM SINGLE CQOURSE CHIP SEAL & LINE STRIPING 2 CAESAR
CREEK STATE PARK.
PRICING BASED ON VENDOR'S ESTIMATE DATED 04.04.2013.
STRAWSER CONSTRUCTICH - EAQK HELM, 8937.657.9527
ODNR - GUS SMITHHISLER, 614.265.6965
"PURCHASELINE | QUANTITY. | UOM | _UNSPSC CODE [ UNITPRICE [ AMOUNT
01 36,961.0000 YD 130120000 $4.670 §172,607.87
SINGLE SOURCE CHIP SEAL
DISTRIBUTION LINE | FUND [FISCAL YEAR| SAC |SPRC| RCAT | ACTIVITY | ACCOUNT CODE| STATE JOBNER. | LINE AMOUNT.
01 7002 13 4BF2 | 0008 | NOCC 526301 488256 $172,607.87
SOMMENTS FOR VENDOR: e ‘ : : = 7
" PURCHASEUINE | QUANTITY | UOM e _ UNSPSC CODE’ UNITPRICE AMOUNT
02 13,126.0000 FT 30120000 $0.580 §7.613.08
i INE STRIPING
'DISTRIBUTION LINE | FUND' |FISCAL YEAR| SAC |SPRC | RCAT | ACTIVITY | ACCOUNT CODE | STATEJOB NBR. | LINE AMOUNT
. 01 7002 13 4BF2 | 0008 | NOCC 526301 488256 $7,613.08
ICOMMENTS FOR VENDOH: : T T = - = e

** BY ACCEPTING THIS PURCHASE ORDER, THE VENDOR HEREIN NAMED AFFIRMS THAT, AS APPLICABLE TO THE VENDOR, NO PARTY
LISTED IN DIVISION (I} OR (J) OF SECTION 3517.13 OF THE REVISED CODE OR SPOUSE OF SUCH PARTY HAS MADE, AS AN INDIVIDUAL,
WITHIN THE TWO PREVIOUS CALENDAR YEARS, ONE OR MORE CONTRIBUTIONS TOTALING IN EXCESS OF $1,000.00 TO THE GOVERNOR

OR TO THE GOVERNOR'S CAMPAIGN COMMITTEES.

THE DIRECTOR OF BUDGET AND MANAGEMENT HEREBY CERTIFIES THAT THERE IS A BALANCE IN THE APPROPRIATION NOT
OTHERWISE OBLIGATED TO PAY PRECEDENT OBLIGATIONS, PURSUANT TO WHICH THE OBLIGATION DETAILED ABOVE IS TO

BE PAID
NOTICE TQ 1. PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST BE PLAINLY MARKED ON ALL PACKAGES AND PAPERS.
SUPPLIER & PRICES QUOTED ARE FIRM. OTHER THAN AS PROVIDED IN THE INVITATION TO BID, INCREASES ARE NOT AUTHORIZED AND WILL NOT 8E PAID,

3. REJECTED GOUDS SHALL REMAIN VENDOR'S PROPERTY.
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From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <ODN/EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/RECIPIENTS/SMITHHISLER, GUS4AE>
To: 1. "Bowman, Bob" <Bob.Bowman@dnr.state.oh.us>
2. "Ferguson, Alan" <Alan.Ferguson@dnr.state.oh.us>
CC: 1. "Filbert, Tom" <Tom.Filbert@dnr.state.oh.us>
2. "Hoffer, Shannon" <Shannon.Hoffer@dnr.state.oh.us>
Subject: FW: Caesar Creek
Sent: 5/13/2013 8:46:28 PM +00:00
Attachments: 1. Final Map of Work.pdf

2. Caesar Creek Notes_Final.xlsx
Embedded graphics: 3
Gentlemen,

Does this timing work for you? | know we don't like to do things after Memorial Day, but it has taken longer than
planned to get the PO from ODOT.

-Gus

From: HELM, Zack (NYCCO) [mailto:Zack.Helm@Strawserconst.com]
Sent: Monday, May 13, 2013 9:52 AM

To: Smithhisler, Gus; Dan Unger (danjunger@gmail.com)

Subject: RE: Caesar Creek

Hey Gus,

Strawser has PO’s in hand and we currently have you scheduled for the 28t (after memorial day
& weather permitting).

From my understanding Dan and his crews are getting up there as early as tomorrow to start with
the repairs.

Attached is a spreadsheet of the work we are doing just so you have in your notes along with
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ps.

I have in my contacts Alan Fergusson @ 937-302-8947 & Shannon Hoffer @ 937-902-4950.

Please let me know if you have any questions and concerns. We appreciate the business this year.

Thanks,

Zack Helm

Technical Marketing Representative
Strawser Construction Inc.

Terry Asphalt Materials Inc.

1595 Frank Rd. Columbus, OH 43223
Office-614-276-5501 Ext 5816
Cell-937-657-9527

Professionals Dedicated to Preserving America’s Roadways

Description: p Descri -
[X Descrigtion: Scl [X ption: (I;)r(:,:scnpn

From: HELM, Zack (NYCCO)

Sent: Monday, April 29, 2013 4:39 PM

To: gus.smithhisler@dnr.state.oh.us; Dan Unger (danjunger@gmail.com)
Subject: Caesar Creek

Hey guys,
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| wanted to include everyone on the email to make sure we are all on the same page regarding Caesar Creek.

Gus, From our previous conversation everything looks fine on ODOT'’s level. We have our team scheduled to

come in on May 20th, through the 22", That is before Memorial Day and also keeps us from doing any work
on a Friday.

Obviously Dan will need to complete his repairs prior to us coming in. If we want to hit that May 20" deadline |

believe Dan will need something signed in writing authorizing the go ahead this week so he can get in there.
Let me know if that will be a problem or not. Again, we will coordinate off your schedule Gus as this is your
baby, but | thought it would be nice to try and complete everything before the holiday. Hopefully we are in the
same line of thinking. | will also need a signed purchase order mid next week to keep us on the above
schedule.

Thanks Gus and please let me know if there is anything else you need from me.

Zack Helm

Technical Marketing Representative
Strawser Construction Inc.

Terry Asphalt Materials Inc.

1595 Frank Rd. Columbus, OH 43223
Office-614-276-5501 Ext 5816
Cell-937-657-9527

Professionals Dedicated to Preserving America’s Roadways

Description: Descri o
[E Descrigtion: SCI [ﬁ ption: [E (?::SC”DU
D i

Message Headers: Received: from SOCEMMBO2.em.ohio.gov ([66.144.48.72]) by SOCEMHUBO
([66.144.48.37]) with mapi id 14.02.0342.003; Mon, 13 May 2013 16
Content-Type: application/ms-tnef; name="winmail.dat"
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Content-Transfer-Encoding: binary

From: "Smithhisler, Gus" <Gus.Smithhisler@dnr.state.oh.us>

To: "Bowman, Bob" <Bob.Bowman@dnr.state.oh.us>, "Ferguson, Alan"
<Alan.Ferguson@dnr.state.oh.us>

CC: "Filbert, Tom" <Tom.Filbert@dnr.state.oh.us>, "Hoffer, Shannon
<Shannon.Hoffer@dnr.state.oh.us>

Subject: FW: Caesar Creek

Thread-Topic: Caesar Creek

Thread-Index: Ac5FFiMigB60HOa0QzWUfuWei8VTEAKx51/gAA8deiA=

Date: Mon, 13 May 2013 16:46:28 -0400

Message-ID: <11A1FA187C64F94DB5A911EA19F6F08F09DAEO@SOCEMMBO2>

Accept-Language: en-US

Content-Language: en-US

X-MS-Has-Attach: yes

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-SCL: -1

X-MS-TNEF-Correlator: <11A1FA187C64F94DBR5A911EA19F6FO08F09DAEQO@SOCE

MIME-Version: 1.0

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthSource: SOCEMHUBO3.em.ohio.gov

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthAs: Internal

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AuthMechanism: 03

X-Originating-IP: [66.145.151.38]

X-MS-Exchange-Organization-AVStamp-Mailbox: MSFTFF;1;0;0 0 O
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SBtrawser
Construction
inc.

Moving Pavement Freservation Forward

Date 6/28013
Terrs Due Upon Recelpt
Job & 10146426 Estimate # 1 ead Final
Customer # 10084102
Pro)# & Nama} Caesar Creek State Park Flbormat 2043 involee #  ©3487
Customer QDOT District 8
Altention ATTN: Emby Justison
Address 1 506 South Sfate Routs 741
Address 2
City, Stala Zip Lebanon, OH, 45038
Phone
<.—This Estimats -~> <---—Fp Dalg —>
Lina Hem Object ftem Coniracl Unit Unit Total Quantity Total Quantity Totsl
em# Nursber  {Account/GL Oestription Qly lised Prica Contract Ami i| Compleled Amount Completed Amptint
40000000 I 40000000 53126 [Fibermat 369641.00 |SY 3 457 31 72,607.8? 38,206.00 | 5 165,082.02 || 38208.00 | $ 159,082.02
40700000] 40700000 53120 |Line Striping T 1312600 |LIF |3 0581 57.613.08} 1312600 |§ 7681308 [ 13,196.00 [§ 7,613,089
$180,220.95 $176,695.10 §176,695.10

i Total Invoice Amount | $ 176,695.10 |

IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS REGARDING THIS INVOICE, PLEASE CONTACT THE COLUMBUS OFFICE

Plzase make check payable to Strawser Consfrustion ine., THANK YOUl

REMITTO:

Strawser Construction, Inc,
3600 Berk Blvd,

Hamiiton, OH 45015

8600 Berk Bivd. *  Hamilton, Ohic 45015 “ 513/ 874-6192 * fFax 513/874-6540
1595 Frank Rd.  * Columbus, Ohic 43223 * 614/ 276-5501 * Fax 614/276-0570

An Equal Oppoctunity Employer
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Strawser
Construction

Inc.

Moving Pavement Preservation Forward

Dale  .AM2hEEEE
Terms Due Upon Receipt
Job # 10148426 Estimate # 2 and Final
Customer # 10084102
Proj # & Name Caesar Creek State Park Flbermat 2013 invoice # . 9B4BT.& CR 1_940'7‘8_'
Customer QPOT District 8
Attention ATTN: Gary L. Middieton, P.E,
Address 1 505 South State Route 741
Address 2
City, State Zip Lebanon, OH, 45036
Phone
<---This Estimate ---—-> < Tp Date ——>
Line Item Object L T llem Contract Unit Unit Total Quantity Total Quantity Total
tern # Number  j|Account/GL Description Qty Used Prica Conteact Amt i Completed Amount Completed Amount
4D000000] | 4000006053120 Fibermat ] 3696100 [SY |8 467 | $172607.87] 35401.0013 15532267 | 7160700 |3 334,404 69
40700000 4070000053120 Line Striping 13,126.00 |LF $ 0.58 $7,613.C_18 f 1342600 | §  7,613.08[ 28252.00{ 8§ 15,226,16
Beduyct for additicnal #304 stone work on Cassar
Crosk State Park Road R-72 authorized by ODNR
and not ODOT. ODNR to pay for this additionat ]
WOrK. 1.00 118 § {165,883.44) -$16,883.44) 1.001 $ (16,883.44) 106 |8  {i6883.44)
3156,052.31 i‘ $ 33274741

i Total Invoice Amount] §

IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS REGARDING THIS iINVOICE, PLEASE CONTACT THE COLUMBUS OFFICE

Pleass make check payabie to Strawser Construction inc.,, THANK YOUIt

THE FOLL QUANTITY OF MEATERIAL AND OR SERVICE ON 1
INEOICE CONEORMS T TERMS OF THF PURCHASE, Ha8 BEEM

34

RISEWED EOR THE SOLE USE OF THE SIATE. 15 CORRECTLY

CHARGEDGHD 1S PRUPEALY RECORDED
m@mmy&m , / Z/ /
- W'Lk,ﬁm, (o7l 7

SIGNAJURE

REMIT TO: (| /5T 059 %

Strawser Construction, Inc
8600 Berk Blvd.
Hamilton, OH 45015

8600 Berk Bivd. * Hamilton, Chio 45015 * 513/ 874-6192 - Fax 513/874-6540
1595 Frank Rd. - Columbus, Ohio 43223 * 614/ 276-5501 * Fax 614/276-0570

An Equal Opportunity Employer
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MORRIS, Tonxa (NYCCO)

From: HERBST, Tim {TERYA)

Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2013 9:08 AM

To: TRAYLINEK, Jordan (NYCCO); MORRIS, Tonya {(NYCCO)

Subject: FW: 2013 Caesar Creek State Park Chip Seal and Line Striping Work
Fyl

From: Middleton, Gary [mailto:Gary.Middieton@dot.state.oh.us]
Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2013 12:52 PM

To: Smithhisler, Gus
Cc: Justison, Emily; HERBST, Tim (TERYA); Alana.Haberman@dot.state.oh.us; Neely, RuthAnn
Subject: 2013 Caesar Creek State Park Chip Seal and Line Striping Work

Gus,

As discussed this date, Strawser Construction Inc. will be compensated by ODOT for the Chip Seal and Line Striping work
authorized by ODOT Purchase Order # 341823 on Caesar Creek Park Roads R-1, R-2, R-3, and R-4 as follows.

UNIT

WORK DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UOM | oo~ | AMOUNT
Single Chip Seal 35,401 S.Y. | $4.67 | $165,322.67
Line Striping 13,126 FT. | $0.58 | $7,613.08
Sub-total $172,935.75

ODOT DEDUCT: Additional
#304 Stone Work on Caesar
Creek State Park Road R-72
authorized by ODNR and not
authorized by an ODOT
Purchase Order.

4,307 S.Y. | $3.92 | (516,883.44)

Total Chip Seal Amount to be

paid by ODOT P.O. # 341823 >156,052.31

Strawser Construction Inc. will be compensated by ODNR for the additional #304 Stone work on Caesar Creek State Park
Road R-72 authorized by ODNR and not authorized by an CDOT Purchase Order as follows.

WORK DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UOM FL’JRT(IZZ AMOUNT

ODNR ADD: Additional #304
Stone Work to be paid by
ODNR an Caesar Creek State
Park Road R-72 authorized by
ODNR and not authorized by an
ODOT Purchase Order.

4,307 SY. | $3.92 | 516,883.44

As agreed, Strawser will submit a revised invoice to ODOT, 505 South 5,R. 741, Lebanon, Ohio 45036 in the amount of
$156,052 .31 as indicated above to be paid via ODOT P.O. #341823. Further, ODNR and Strawser will discuss and
determine payment options/methods for the #304 Stone work performed on Road R-72.

1
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Any gquestions please call.
Respectfully,

Gary L. Middleton, P.E.
District 8 Staff Engineer
505 South S.R, 741
Lebanon, Ohio 45036

Ph. 513-933-6528
http://www.dot.state.oh.us
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Strawser Invoice

Construction

Inc. RECEIVED

Moving Pavement Preservation Forward NUV i 9 2013
DEPT. OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION ‘OF ENGINEERING
Date 111213
Terms Dus Upon Receipt
Job # 10148426 Estmate # 2 and Final
I
Customer # 10084102
Proj # & Name Caesar Creek State Park Fibermat 2013 Invoice # 98487
Customer Ohlo Department of Natural Resources
Attention ATTN: Gus Smithhisler
Address 1 2045 Morse Road
Address 2
City, Stata Zip Columbus, OH 43229
Phone
<----This Estimate ----> < Tp Datg ———>
Line Kem Qbject Item Contract|| Unit Unit Total Quantity Total Quantity Total
Item# tumber || AccountGL Description Qiy Used Price Contract Amt || Complsted Amount Completed Amaunt
Additional #304 stone wark on Caesar Crask State Park Road
R-72 authorized by ODNR and not ODOT. ODNR to pay for ’
s51320{this additicnal work. 1.00 |LS $ 16,883.44 $16,883.44 1.00])% 1688344 10018 16,883.44
$16,863.44) $ 16,883.44
|  Total Invoice Amount] $ 16,883.44 |

IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS REGARDING THIS INVOICE, PLEASE CONTACT THE COLUMBUS OFFICE

Please make check payable to Strawser Construction Inc., THANK YOUI!

iz
\9 t‘[go‘
0¥

REMIT TO:

Strawser Construction, Inc.
8600 Berk Blvd.

Hamilton, OH 45015

8600 Berk Blvd. * Hamilton, Ohio 45015 * 513/ 874-6192 * Fax 513/874-6540
1595 Frank Rd. = Columbus, Ohio 43223 © 614/ 276-5501 * Fax 614/276-0570

An Equal Opportunity Employer
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